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This unique book challenges the traditional distinction between eros, the love found in Greek thought, and
agape, the love characteristic of Christianity. Focusing on a number of classic texts, including Plato's
Symposium and Lysis, Aristotle's Ethics and Metaphysics,, and famous passages in Gregory of Nyssa,
Origen, Dionysius the Areopagite, Plotinus, Augustine, and Thomas Aquinas, the author shows that Plato's
account of eros is not founded on self-interest. In this way, she restores the place of erotic love as a Christian
motif, and unravels some longstanding confusions in philosophical discussions of love.
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From reader reviews:

Benjamin Deloatch:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time?
What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question simply
because just their can do this. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need that Eros Unveiled: Plato and the God of Love
(Clarendon Paperbacks) to read.

Chad Steinberger:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Eros Unveiled: Plato and the God
of Love (Clarendon Paperbacks) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading
this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world much
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only
for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to
start looking at as your good habit, it is possible to pick Eros Unveiled: Plato and the God of Love
(Clarendon Paperbacks) become your starter.

Barbara Robbins:

The book untitled Eros Unveiled: Plato and the God of Love (Clarendon Paperbacks) contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very clear to
see all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous
author. The author gives you in the new age of literary works. You can read this book because you can read
on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy
the e-book, you can open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice read.

Teresa White:

It is possible to spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This Eros Unveiled: Plato and the
God of Love (Clarendon Paperbacks) is simple bringing you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach,
train and also soon. If you did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book.
It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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